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The delusional misidentification syndromes are characterized by misidentifica- 
tion delusions of others or of the self. Aggressive ideas or behaviors often ac- 
company these delusions. The relationship between delusional misidentification 
and dangerousness remains for the most part poorly understood. In the present 
article, we compare a group of dangerous individuals suffering from dangerous 
misidentification delusions with a group of dangerous individuals suffering from 
other types of delusions. Individuals with dangerous misidentification delusions 
were more likely to experience grandiose ideation, thought disorder, generalized 
hostility, excitement, general psychopathology, and a previous history of vio- 
lence than dangerous delusional individuals with no delusional misidentification. 
The group with dangerous delusional misidentification syndromes was less likely 
to attack others with weapons than were the dangerous delusional group with no 
delusional misidentification. 

Although there has been relatively little 
empirical work in defining the relation- 
ship between delusions and behavior, a 
hypothesis commonly held by the psychi- 
atric professional community is that indi- 
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viduals rarely act upon their delusions.' 
This makes sense clinically, as even in the 
extreme cases of chronically delusional 
and so-called high-risk assaultive persons 
housed in secure hospital settings, actual- 
ized physical violence is a low-base-rate 
phenomenon occurring in only a small 
percentage of the patients7 total hospital- 
ization time. However, studies have been 
conducted examining the converse- 
whether delusional beliefs have been as- 
sociated with abnormal behavior, espe- 
cially criminal or dangerous  behavior^.^ 
In this manner, the hypothesis that delu- 
sional thinking has a significant role in 
the commission of criminal behaviors or 
acts of violence has credence. 
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Recently there has been a significant 
attempt to examine the relationship be- 
tween delusions and action." These 
studies used both patient and informant 
reports to arrive at their findings and 
showed that actions associated with ab- 
normal beliefs were more common than 
previously suggested.' They also found 
that there was no association between the 
delusional thinking and acting on the 
delusion when an informant provided in- 
formation, but that when the patients 
themselves were queried, their actions 
were associated with delusional content 
and with dysphoric or anxious feelings 
associated with their delus ions .~owever  
these studies did not address in depth the 
more specific issue about the possible 
linkage between delusions and aggressive 
behavior. Therefore, considerable further 
exploration remains to be done before this 
relationship can be more fully under- 
stood. 

In his review of acting on delusions, 
~ u c h a n a n ~  covered the different types of 
delusions, including persecutory, jealous, 
grandiose, passivity, ill health or bodily 
change, erotomanic, Capgras, guilt, reli- 
gious, and sexual. In this article, we focus 
on misidentification delusions. These 
delusions encompass more than one cate- 
gory of delusional thinking, particularly 
persecutory, grandiose, and somatic. They 
also have been cited as an example of po- 
tentially "dangerous" delusions by De- 
Pauw and ~ z u l e c k a . ~  In the past five years 
these dangerous delusions have received 
significant forensic attention in the anglo- 
phonic medical l i t e r a t ~ r e . ~ ~ '  

The delusional misidentification syn- 
dromes are chiefly characterized by a de- 

lusion of inauthenticity regarding the 
identity of others or the self." For exam- 
ple, in the most common delusional 
misidentification syndrome, Capgras syn- 
drome, the affected person questions the 
identity of others, and as a result of this 
experience the person usually postulates 
the existence of doubles or imposters. 11,12 

Delusional misidentification can also 
occur in reference to the person's own 
self. These cases are also known as "re- 
verse" delusional misidentification syn- 
dromes.13 

The study of misidentification delu- 
sions provides a potential interactive 
model between delusions and resultant 
dangerous behaviors. There are several 
reasons for this. First, each misidentifica- 
tion syndrome presents with a different 
constellation of features that may repre- 
sent potential modifiers regarding degrees 
of associated dangerousness. These fea- 
tures include such factors as paranoia, 
grandiosity, affective symptomatology, 
and emotional proximity to the delusion- 
ally misidentified object. Second, recent 
progress in the classification of delusional 
misidentification syndromes facilitates 
the collection of relevant psychopath- 
ology into a more cohesive system 
and thereby encourages more systemic 
studY.''' 13' l4 Third, advances in neu- 
ropsychiatric research indicate that 
right (nondominant) brain abnormali- 
ties,15' l6 including face misrecognition 
and other forms of topographical recogni- 
tion de f i~ i t s , '~ - '%a~  be associated with 
delusional misidentification phenomena. 
Therefore, misidentification delusions 
offer a unique opportunity to develop an 
integrated model of psychosis in which 
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phenomenologic, biological, and forensic 
aspects are rele~ant.~OSuch a model could 
shed light on the mechanisms of the gene- 
sis of dangerous delusions and the resul- 
tant dangerous behaviors. 

In this article, we report a study of 25 
subjects who suffered from aggressive 
delusional misidentification syndromes. 
This group is compared with a group of 
25 aggressive delusional subjects who 
harbored no delusional misidentification. 
Factors that may predispose delusional 
misidentification individuals to become 
hostile are explored. A case is presented 
in order to highlight the main issues intro- 
duced by dangerous delusional misidenti- 
fication. 

Methods 
The data were collected over a five- 

year period on 25 subjects suffering from 
nonmisidentification delusions (NMD) 
and 25 subjects suffering from misidenti- 
fication delusions (MD). Information on 
demographics, dangerousness, phenome- 
nology, and diagnosis was collected via 
review of records. Psychiatric diagnosis 
were made in accordance with DSM-III- 
R   rite ria.^' The subjects were routinely 
rated, using the Brief Psychiatric Rating 
Scale (BPRS) ,~~ ,  23 by the first author, 
who had been previously calibrated on the 
scale. Criteria for dangerousness con- 
sisted of either serious verbal aggression 
or physical aggression. Serious verbal ag- 
gression was defined as oral threats to 
harm another that had led to the subject's 
civil or criminal confinement. Physical 
aggression or violence was defined as any 
attack that culminated with bodily con- 

tact. The use of weapons by the attacker 
was also recorded. 

All subjects were rated for misidentifi- 
cation delusions. Although we have so far 
used the term "misidentification delu- 
sions," controversy remains as to whether 
these delusions in fact comprise a sepa- 
rate syndrome. We will use hereafter the 
term "delusional misidentification syn- 
drome" interchangeably with "misidenti- 
fication delusions," because much of the 
world's literature uses the term syndrome; 
for example, "Capgras syndrome" instead 
of "Capgras delusion." The following def- 
initions were used for delusional misiden- 
tification of others: the Capgras delusion 
occurs when an individual believes that 
there has been a radical change in the psy- 
chological, but not physical, appearance 
of another; 24, 25 the FrCgoli delusion 
occurs when an individual believes in a 
radical change in the physical, but not 
psychological, identity of another; 10, 26, 27 

the intermetamorphosis delusion occurs 
when a person believes in radical changes 
in both the physical and psychological 
identities of another. lo' 28> 2') Definitions 
for delusional misidentification of the self 
include the following: the "subjective7' 
Capgras delusion occurs when the delu- 
sional person believes that physical repli- 
cas of him/herself exist although these 
replicas have different psychological 
identities (minds) from that of the per- 
son's original identity;7' 30 the "reverse" 
Capgras delusion occurs when an individ- 
ual believes that hislher own psychologi- 
cal, but not physical, identity has radically 
changed; "', l3 and the "reverse" intermeta- 
morphosis delusion occurs when the delu- 
sional person believes that helshe has 
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undergone fundamental changes in both 
physical and psychological identities.''' 31 

The MD group was compared to the 
NMD group in regard to each BPRS item, 
total BPRS score, and five BPRS subfac- 
tors,23 the presence of grandiose delu- 
sions, the presence of persecutory delu- 
sions, physical violence, and whether 
weapons were used during an attack. 
Only the index delusions present during 
the evaluation were included in the pre- 
sent analysis. Categorical variables were 
analyzed using the Pearson chi-square 
statistic on SPSS software (SPSS Inc., 
Chicago, IL). Interval variables were ana- 
lyzed using the two-tailed t test statistic 
on SPSS. 

Results 
Both the MD and NMD groups con- 

sisted of 23 males and two females. The 
average ages for the MD and NMD 
groups were 36.1 and 37.2 years, respec- 
tively. The MD group consisted of 11 
African-Americans, four Hispanic whites, 
one Hispanic black, eight other whites, 
and one Asian. The NMD group con- 
tained five African-Americans, 10 His- 
panic whites, one Hispanic black, eight 

other whites, and one Native American. 
The MD group included 14 single, seven 
divorced, and four married subjects; the 
NMD group included 17 singles, one sep- 
arated, four divorced, and three married 
subjects. Members of the NMD group 
were significantly more likely to attack 
others using weapons (x2 = 8.117, df = 1, 
p < .01). No statistically significant dif- 
ferences were noted in regard to non- 
weapon attacks. Individuals in the MD 
group were significantly more likely to 
have a violent history independent of dan- 
gerous behaviors resulting from a mis- 
identification delusion (x2 = 17.01, 
df = 1, p < .01). Grandiose delusions 
were significantly associated with danger- 
ous misidentification delusions (x2 = 

18.47, df = 1 , p  < .01). All but 1 of the 50 
subjects suffered from paranoid delusions. 
The specific components of the BPRS re- 
sults that were found to show statistically 
significant differences between the MD 
and NMD groups are presented in Table 1. 

The diagnostic profile for both the MD 
and NMD groups is presented in Table 2. 
Table 3 illustrates the types of misidentifi- 
cation delusions encountered in the MD 
sample. 

Table 1 
BPRS Scores by Group 

BPRS Scale MD Group NMD Group t test 

Grandiosity 3.64 1.72 3.69' 
Unusual thought content 6.00 3.12 5.01 ' 
Excitement 3.40 2.68 2.06* 
Thought disorder subfactor 21.60 16.16 4.71' 
Hostility subfactor 14.68 11.88 2.61' 
Total BPRS score 49.64 42.36 3.60~ 
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Table 2 
Diagnostic Distribution by Group 

MD NMD 
Group Group 

Paranoid schizophrenia 18 19 
Schizoaffective disorder 3 1 
Organic delusional 

disorder 1 0 
Psychotic disorder not 

otherwise specified 2 5 
Bipolar disorder 1 0 

Case History 
Mr. A is a 30-year-old man who was 

involuntarily psychiatrically hospitalized 
after hitting his sister with his hands. At 
that time his sister was carrying her baby 
in her arms and, as a result of the attack, 
her baby fell on the floor. Mr. A attacked 
her because of his belief that she had been 
replaced by a malevolent double. He fur- 
ther believed that his sister, mother, and 
grandmother had been replaced by physi- 
cal doubles who were Mafia members 
with plans to kill him. Mr. A believed the 
original family members had been kid- 
napped by the Mafia. Mr. A became 
hostile toward the misidentified family 
members because they questioned his 

Table 3 
Frequency of Misidentification Delusions 

Type of Delusion N (%) 

Capgras 15 (33.3) 
"Reverse" Capgras 14 (31 . l )  
"Subjective" Capgras 2 (4.4) 
Fregoli 2 (4.4) 
lnterrnetarnorphosis 6 (1 3.3) 
"Reverse" interrnetarnorphosis 6 (1 3.3) 
Total 45 (1 OO)* 

*Total N > 25 because a person can experience more 
than one type of misidentification delusion. 

grandiose claims of supernatural powers 
and delusional misidentification. On one 
occasion he had held a gun to the alleged 
"double" of his grandmother. On another 
occasion he had threatened to burn the 
house down in order to destroy the dou- 
bles. On still another occasion, Mr. A had 
turned on the gas during the night intend- 
ing to kill the impostors of his family. He 
also had a history of assaulting strangers 
and police officers, whom he did not 
misidentify. 

In the index hospitalization, Mr. A had 
become agitated and combative toward 
hospital staff, none of whom he misiden- 
tified. He believed that he possessed spir- 
itual powers upon which he declined to 
elaborate. His mood was labile and his af- 
fect was hostile. He denied a history of 
head injury or major physical illness. 
There was no family history for mental 
disorder. 

His physical, including neurological, 
examination was unremarkable. His rou- 
tine serum chemistry panel, complete 
blood count, and urinalysis were within 
normal limits. Mr. A met DSM-111-R di- 
agnostic criteria for psychosis not other- 
wise specified.21 He was treated with 
haloperidol with substantial diminution of 
his paranoia, anxiety, agitation, and im- 
pulsivity. His misidentification delusions, 
however, persisted. 

Discussion 
Both groups were 92 percent male, 

consistent with the approximately 90 per- 
cent male population of the facilities from 
which the subjects were collected. In gen- 
eral, however, misidentification delusions 
probably have a similar frequency in both 
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genders, although the literature suggests a 
slight female predominance. 247 25 There 
was no significant difference between the 
mean ages of the MD group (36.1 years) 
and the NMD group (37.2 years). Both 
groups were composed of about one-third 
other white individuals, with the remain- 
ing subjects divided primarily among 
Hispanic whites and American and His- 
panic blacks. These ethnic distributions 
are representative of the racial and ethnic 
compositions of the institutions from 
which the subjects were gathered. Mem- 
bers of both groups were largely not mar- 
ried (single and never married, divorced, 
or separated) at 84 percent for the MD 
group and 88 percent for the NMD group. 
The marital status of the subjects likely 
reflects the well-known difficulties en- 
countered by psychotic individuals in de- 
veloping interpersonal relationships.32 

The case of Mr. A is representative of 
the MD group in that he harbored para- 
noid delusions. In fact, 96 percent of the 
MD subjects suffered from paranoid delu- 
sions. Diagnostically, paranoid schizo- 
phrenia is the most common mental dis- 
order noted in prior studies of delusional 
mi~ident i f ica t ion,~~~ 253 33 and this was also 
the case for the current MD sample. How- 
ever, the frequency of paranoid schizo- 
phrenia is essentially the same for the MD 
and NMD groups in this study (see Table 
2). These results, coupled with no signifi- 
cant differences in paranoid delusional 
content between the MD and NMD sam- 
ples, suggest that the paranoid component 
in misidentification delusions alone can- 
not adequately explain predisposition to- 
ward aggressive ideas and actions. None- 
theless, paranoid delusions in general 

may predispose aggressive individuals to 
become more violent.34 

The case of Mr. A is illustrative of the 
Capgras delusion with his mother, sister, 
and grandmother as the delusionally mis- 
identified objects. These three relatives 
qualify as Capgras objects because Mr. A 
conceptualized them as physical replicas 
of the original relatives who now had rad- 
ically changed minds from the "real" rela- 
t ive~ . '~ '  " As reported in Table 3, the Cap- 
gras delusion was the most frequently 
reported delusion, accounting for one- 
third of the misidentification delusions in 
our sample. The "subjective" and "re- 
verse" Capgras variants accounted for an- 
other 35.5 percent of the misidentification 
delusions. The intermetamorphosis and 
"reverse" intermetamorphosis delusions 
were the next most frequent, with a com- 
bined frequency of 26.6 percent. The Fre- 
goli delusion accounted for 4.4 percent of 
the misidentification delusions. The de- 
creasing frequency of the different types 
of misidentification delusions from Cap- 
gras to intermetamorphosis to Fregoli has 
been noted previously.29~ 35 However, the 
significance of these frequencies for dif- 
ferent misidentification delusions, if any, 
remains unclear. Furthermore, the present 
results do not allow us to differentiate as 
to whether or not specific types of 
misidentification delusions carry a dif- 
ferent risk for dangerousness. These 
questions may be explored when larger 
numbers of specific dangerous misidenti- 
fication delusion subjects become avail- 
able for analysis. 

Some misidentification delusions in- 
volving the self involve grandiose delu- 
sions. This may be the case because these 
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persons frequently misidentify them- 
selves for powerful and famous people. 
These delusions can drive some individu- 
als to attack others who do not acknowl- 
edge the subject's new personal identity.7 
In the present study, misidentification 
delusions were significantly associated 
with grandiose delusions, consistent with 
previous findings.7 The case of Mr. A il- 
lustrates some of these interactions. Mr. A 
displayed not only misidentification delu- 
sions, but also paranoid and grandiose 
components to his delusions. Although he 
did not misidentify himself, he believed 
he had special supernatural powers and 
would become especially angry at the 
delusionally misidentified and mistrusted 
relatives when he learned that they did not 
share in this grandiose belief. This real- 
ization made him even more motivated to 
harm his relatives. 

When weapons were used during an at- 
tack, the NMD group was more likely to 
use them than the MD group. However, 
neither group showed a preference for un- 
armed assaults. A possible explanation for 
these results is that the NMD subjects are 
more organized in their abilities to plan 
than the MD subjects and therefore are 
more successful at procuring weapons as 
mapped out by the plan of attack. The re- 
sults of the BPRS suggest this possible in- 
terpretation. First, if the total BPRS score 
is assumed to be an indicator of overall 
psychopathology, the MD group is signif- 
icantly more impaired than the NMD 
group. Second, the thought disorder sub- 
scale score is also significantly higher for 
the MD than NMD group. This subscale 
is associated with very severe psycho- 
pathology, which impairs the individual's 

reality testing and ability to plan logically 
and hence to obtain a weapon. 

The BPRS grandiosity item resulted in 
a significantly higher score for the MD 
than the NMD group. This result follows 
from the previously discussed finding that 
dangerous MD subjects suffer from more 
delusional grandiosity than NMD sub- 
jects. The finding that excitement as mea- 
sured by the BPRS is also significantly 
greater for MD subjects than NMD sub- 
jects is consistent with the results on 
grandiosity, because both grandiosity and 
excitement can be found to co-occur in 
psychotic states. The BPRS "unusual 
thought content" item was found to be 
significantly associated with the MD 
group. This is not unexpected given that 
delusional misidentification by its very 
nature presents with unusual ideas that 
may be termed as bizarre in content. 

In conclusion, the results of the present 
study provide the first evidence that as a 
group dangerous MD subjects, in compar- 
ison with dangerous NMD subjects, may 
have a higher level of overall psy- 
chopathology, higher degree of delusional 
grandiosity, and greater thought disorga- 
nization. The results of our study also 
suggest that subjects from the MD group 
may suffer from a greater degree of gen- 
eral hostility. However, this hostility may 
not always be translated into physical ag- 
gression as subjects from the NMD group 
appear to be better organized and as a re- 
sult more capable of creating plans of at- 
tacks and executing such plans. 

An important aspect of our study is that 
it represents the first known attempt in 
which a group of dangerous MD individ- 
uals has been studied using a control 
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group. To our knowledge, it is also the 
first study to employ a psychometric ap- 
proach in the study of aggression in the 
context of delusional misidentification. It 
is important to emphasize that the find- 
ings of our study are preliminary in 
nature, and better characterization of 
relevant factors in dangerous misidentifi- 
cation delusions must await more strin- 
gent classification and measurement of 
delusional misidentification phenomena. 
In addition, more comprehensive mea- 
sures of psychopathology may need to be 
employed in order to have a better under- 
standing of potential interactions between 
misidentification delusions and other 
markers of psychopathology and danger- 
ousness. 

The results of the present study cannot 
determine whether misidentification delu- 
sions are more frequent and more danger- 
ous in community settings than are other 
delusions. We emphasize that although 
our data suggest that misidentification 
delusions may represent an additive risk 
factor for aggression in comparison to 
other delusions, this preliminary finding 
awaits replication. Because of the prelim- 
inary nature of our findings, misidentifi- 
cation delusions can be considered only a 
risk factor in evaluating a psychotic pa- 
tient's level of dangerousness. Finally, the 
lifetime prevalence of dangerous misiden- 
tification delusions will require careful 
phenomenologic and forensic characteri- 
zation of large well-controlled samples of 
psychotic individuals in the community. 
An integrated phenomenologic, forensic, 
biologic, and epidemiologic approach 
may eventually lead to better mechanistic 
models of the dangerousness posed by 

persons with psychotic disorders involv- 
ing delusions. 
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