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This project describes the psychopathology and personality findings in 14 juve- 
niles who committed sexual homicide. These incarcerated youth were assessed 
using a structured interview, a personality assessment instrument, correctional 
files review, and an author-designed clinical interview. Nearly all of these youth 
met DSM-Ill-R conduct disorder criteria at the time of the crime. The presence of 
personality disorders and moderately high psychopathy scores at follow-up were 
common. Two-thirds of these youth reported the presence of violent sexual 
fantasies before their crimes. Weapons, most often knives, were used by these 
juvenile sexual murderers to kill known victims in a majority of the cases. They 
usually acted alone and selected a low risk victim. These findings suggest that 
juvenile sexual murderers are an emotionally and behaviorally disturbed popula- 
tion with identifiable psychopathology, personality disturbances, and criminal 
patterns. 

Sexual homicide involves "a sexual ele- 
ment (activity) as the basis for the se- 
quence of acts leading to death."' This 
crime will include some form of sexual 
assault or sexually symbolic behavior 
combined with a homicidal act. 

Sadistic fantasy, often escalating over 
time and eventually resulting in behav- 
ioral try-outs, is postulated to be a root 
cause in many cases.* Fantasy is not just 
an integral part of sexual excitement, but 
also of the  perversion^.^ catathymia4. is 
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theorized to lead to other sex murders. In 
this phenomenon, the offender's psycho- 
logical equilibrium is overwhelmed by 
powerful emotions stemming from a con- 
flictual relationship, and catastrophic, un- 
provoked sexual violence results as the 
tension is released. 

The premeditated crime based on sa- 
distic fantasy corresponds to what crime 
classification experts refer to as "orga- 
nized'' sexual homicide, whereas the un- 
planned, chaotic crime, or catathymic 
type of crime, is referred to as the "dis- 
organized" type.6 The organized offender 
plans his murders, targets his victims, and 
displays control at the crime scene. In 
contrast, the disorganized offender com- 
mits an unplanned, spontaneous act, often 
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against a known victim. These two crime 
categories are generally applied during 
crime scene analysis. 

In adult sexual murderers, it is believed 
that psychopathology is common, partic- 
ularly personality disorder diagnoses of 
the antisocial, narcissistic, borderline, and 
sadistic types.2, 7 7  Similarly, psychopa- 
thology in juveniles who have committed 
nonsexual murderers is a common find- 
ing, which can be manifested by disrup- 
tive behavior disorders as well as person- 
ality  disturbance^.^-'^ However, no 
systematic studies of youth who have 
committed sexual homicide currently ex- 
ist. As a result, little is known about their 
psychological functioning and the nature 
and scope of their presumed psychopa- 
thology. 

There are scattered case reports over 
the last half-century and a small case se- 
ries in the literature"-l9 that describe 
sexual murders and related acts by ado- 
lescents. These cases provide more ques- 
tions than answers about this form of 
deviant behavior, as illustrated by the fol- 
lowing examples. 

For instance, in the 1924 case of The 
State of Illinois v. Leopold and Loeb, two 
teenage boys from wealthy, influential 
families in Chicago kidnapped, sexually 
assaulted, and murdered (using a chisel) a 
14-year-old boy. They had studied Ni- 
etzsche and interpreted his writings to 
mean that certain supremely talented in- 
dividuals were beyond good and evil and 
owed allegiance not to any moral law but 
instead to their own will. The two boys 
then set out to commit the perfect crime. 
During trial preparation, Leopold stated: 
"The killing was an experiment. . . . It is 

just as easy to justify such a death as it is 
to justify an entomologist in killing a 
beetle on a pin."13 

~ r a f f t - ~ b i n g ' ~  described the case of a 
14-year-old boy who bound, bit, tortured. 
and mutilated nine children, two of whom 
he murdered at the end of the sadistic 
rituals. He was pronounced a "moral idi- 
ot.'' He was characterized as having good 
intellectual powers, but was also "intrac- 
table, disobedient, and beyond control," 
as well as a loner and suspicious. The 
presence of sadistic fantasies brought on 
by the sight of a possible victim was 
noted. 

patterson I s  reported on a 14-year-old 
youth with mild mental retardation who 
killed a neighborhood boy using a knife 
and an axe and then mutilated his geni- 
tals. The author remarked that this case 
was never satisfactorily understood. 

~ r z a z g a ' ~  documented the case of a 
14-year-old boy who was found respon- 
sible for bludgeoning and roasting over a 
fire the partly denuded body of a young 
girl. The youth explained that the act was 
the result of a mysterious urge that had 
come over him. 

RussellI7 wrote about a 14-year-old 
boy who struck a male friend's mother in 
the back with a knife so that he could 
sexually assault her. His assessment re- 
vealed a severe impulse disorder and poor 
ego controls. 

Ressler et al.I8 described the case of a 
teenager who committed 12 rapes and 
rape-murders over a four-year period. At 
the time of his first rape-murder he was 
18, thus technically an adult. He had an 
extensive criminal history antedating his 
crimes, and was later diagnosed with an 
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adolescent adjustment reaction, character 
disorder, and multiple personality (DSM- 
111). 

~ y e r s ' ~  reported on the diagnostic and 
clinical findings in three cases of adoles- 
cent sexual homicide. Two of the three 
boys were diagnosed with conduct disor- 
der, and all three had signs of neuropsy- 
chiatric dysfunction (e.g., learning dis- 
abilities, past encephalopathic events). 

This purpose of this current research 
was to systematically study as large a 
sample of juvenile sexual murderers as 
possible in order to increase our under- 
standing of the psychopathology, person- 
ality characteristics, and criminal patterns 
underlying their offenses. This study was 
undertaken knowing that such crimes are 
rare, and that a large sample would not be 
obtainable. According to the 1995 Fed- 
eral Bureau of Investigation (FBI) Uni- 
form Crime ~ e p o r t s , ~ '  there were approx- 
imately 25,000 murders committed in the 
United States in 1994, and less than 15 
percent of these killings were carried out 
by juveniles under than 18 years of age. 
Only .5 percent of these 25,000 crimes 
involved rape or other sex offenses as a 
component of the murder circumstances. 
These figures demonstrate the rarity of 
sexual homicides by juveniles. 

Methods 
Subjects A state department of cor- 

rections (DOC) computer search identi- 
fied 14 offenders who had entered the 
prison system between January 1990 and 
January 1996 (72-month period), and had 
simultaneously committed sexual assault 
and homicidelattempted homicide while 
under 18 years of age. This sample was 

culled from approximately 1,500 youths 
under the age of 18 who had committed 
homicide during this same six-year time 
period. Several cases in which the victim 
survived were included because the intent 
of the offender was clearly to kill and the 
victim's survival was by chance (e.g.. 
survival of the victim after suffering re- 
peated vigorous neck slashings with a 
knife). Mean age of the sample at the time 
of the crimes was 15.2 years (range, 13 to 
17 years) and mean age at follow-up as- 
sessment was 18.8 years (range. 16 to 23 
years). Seven were white (50%) and 
seven were black (50%). All were male. 
Average IQ was 10 1.4 (range 78 to 1 19). 
Hollingshead and Redlick Two Factor In- 
dex for social status averaged 3.93 -t 0.62 
(range I11 to IV). placing these youths in 
the lower range of socioeconomic status. 

Instruments To assess Axis I disor- 
ders, The DSM-111-R Diagnostic Inter- 
view for Children and Adolescents 
(DICA-R)~'  was administered. This is a 
structured diagnostic interview that cov- 
ers the major psychiatric disorders of 
childhood. The author (W.C.M.) has suc- 
cessfully used the DICA-R with other 
samples of juvenile  murderer^.'^, ' ' 

Subjects were administered the Sched- 
ule for Nonadaptive and Adaptive Per- 
sonality (SNAP), a truelfalse 375-item 
self-report inventory designed to assess 
the psychopathology associated with per- 
sonality disorders.22 The SNAP allows 
for the diagnosis of the 13 DSM-111-R 
personality disorders and has acceptable 
validity and reliability.23 This inventory 
has three groups of scales: (1) validity 
scales, including an inconsistency scale 
and rare virtues scale: (2) DSM-111-R per- 
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sonality disorder scales, including sadis- 
tic and self-defeating; and (3) normal per- 
sonality scales. The normal personality 
scales are organized to measure three of 
the "big five" personality dimensions that 
have been identified in trait approaches to 
the measurement of personality. The 
three dimensions assessed on the SNAP 
are Negative Temperament (Neuroti- 
cism), Positive Temperament (Extraver- 
sion), and Disinhibition. Within each ma- 
jor dimension there are subscales (e.g., 
subscales of Negative Temperament in- 
clude "manipulativeness" and "eccentric 
perceptions"). The normative group used 
in these analyses comprised 25 1 college 
males attending Southern Methodist Uni- 
~ e r s i t ~ . ~ ~  

The Revised Psychopathy Checklist 
( P C L - R ) ~ ~  was used to measure psychop- 
athy dimensionally. The modified scoring 
procedure for youth as described by Forth 
et was used. This instrument yields a 
psychopathy score ranging from 0 
through 40. with a score of 30 or above 
generally used to identify the psycho- 
pathic personality. The mean PCL-R 
scores of younger male prison inmates 
with conduct disorder range between 23.2 
and 28.6.263 27 

A five-page author-designed clinical 
interview was used to cover the areas of 
family background, medical history, edu- 
cation history. child abuse, sexuality, 
crime variables, violent sexual fantasies, 
and victimology. Correctional files for 
each of the subjects were also reviewed. 

One youth (No. 14) declined to partic- 
ipate in the clinical interview portion of 
the assessment procedure, but completed 
the psychological testing portion of the 

study and allowed his correctional files to 
be reviewed. Therefore, certain percent- 
ages in the results will reflect a denomi- 
nator of 13 instead of 14 when the infor- 
mation on subject 14 was unavailable. 

Procedure This study was approved 
by the University of Florida Institutional 
Review Board. Written informed consent 
was obtained from all subjects after the 
nature and purpose of the project was 
explained to them. They were informed 
that the research results would not be 
available for parole or appeal purposes. 
One of the authors (W.C.M.) carried out 
the clinical assessment procedures at the 
several correctional facilities housing 
these youth. 

Results 
Psychopathology Table 1 lists Axis I 

diagnoses for the sample at the time of 
their crimes and personality disorders and 
psychopathy scores at follow-up. Twelve 
youths manifested one or more Axis I 
diagnoses at the time of the crimes, with 
conduct disorder being the most common 
(n = 12; 86%). Other Axis I diagnoses 
included substance abuse disorders in six 
subjects (43%), attention deficit hyperac- 
tivity disorder (ADHD) in three (2 1 %), 
anxiety disorders in three (21%), and dys- 
thymia in two (14%). The sample aver- 
aged 2.3 Axis I disorders per individual 
(range, 0 to 6). 

None of the youth were found to have 
a current or past psychotic disorder, such 
as schizophrenia or a delusional disorder. 
by DICA-R or clinical interview. How- 
ever, a history of psychotic symptoms, 
assessed by the DICA-R, clinical inter- 
view, and a review of their records, was 
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TABLE 1 
Axis I Disorders Present at the Time of the Crimes and Personality Disorder Diagnoses and 

Psychopathy Scores at Follow-up 

Subject DlCA Diagnoses 

Conduct disorder 

Conduct disorder 
Dysthymia 
Alcohol abuse 
Marijuana abuse 

Conduct disorder 
Alcohol abuse 
Marijuana abuse 
Hallucinogen abuse 

None 

Conduct disorder 
ADHD 

Conduct disorder 

Conduct disorder 
ADHD 
Snake phobia 

Conduct disorder 
ADHD, OCD 
Bipolar disorder 
Overanxious disorder 
Separation anxiety disorde~ 

Conduct disorder 
Dysthymia 

None 

Conduct disorder 
Alcohol abuse 

Conduct disorder 
Marijuana abuse 
Roach phobia 

Conduct disorder 
Marijuana abuse 

Conduct disorder 
Marijuana abuse 

SNAP Diagnoses PCL-R Scores 

Schizoid, schizotypal, avoidant, sadistic 

Borderline, sadistic, passive-aggressive 

Schizoid, schizotypal, avoidant 

None 

None 

Paranoid, schizoid, schizotypal, 
antisocial, sadistic, passive-aggressive 

Sadistic 

Paranoid, schizotypal, avoidant, 
dependent, self-defeating 

None 

None 

None 

Schizoid 

Schizoid, schizotypal 

Invalid profile 

- 
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found in 11 (85%) of the youth. Most 
common was paranoid ideation, usually 
described as feeling as if one is being 
watched. talked about, or plotted against 
(n = 8: 62%). Other psychotic symptoms 
were auditory hallucinations (n  = 4; 
31%): blurring of boundaries between 
fantasy and reality ( e g .  encounters with 
phantoms, paranormal convictions, em- 
powerment by God to predict the future) 
(n = 5 ;  38%): ideas of having one's mind 
read (n  = 4; 3 1%); ideas of reading oth- 
er's minds (n = 2; 15%); and visual hal- 
lucinations (n = l ;  8%). Although these 
symptoms were common in the sample 
and of sufficient magnitude to warrant 
documentation, they were not reported as 
being consistently experienced or leading 
to a major disturbance in psychosocial 
adaptation to justify a psychotic disorder 
diagnosis. 

The SNAP results were valid for 13 of 
the 14 young men who took this test. The 
one youth with an invalid profile en- 
dorsed an unusually large number of 
items on the Rare Virtues and the Devi- 
ance scales. The expectation was that 
these offenders would demonstrate a high 
degree of personality disorder psychopa- 
thology, particularly antisocial, border- 
line, and perhaps sadistic symptoma- 
tology. 

As shown in Table 1, 8 of the 13 sub- 
jects (62%) met the SNAP criteria for at 
least one personality disorder. Diagnoses 
were made conservatively, with a t 
score > 65 used as the cut-off criterion. 
Contrary to expectations, however, anti- 
social and borderline diagnoses did not 
occur frequently. In fact, these youths 
demonstrated more DSM-111-R cluster A 

20 30 40 50 60 70 80 

Neuroticism 

Figure 1. SNAP personality dimensions: extraversion 
versus neuroticism. 

symplo~natology (the paranoid, schizoid, 
and schizotypal personality disorder spec- 
trum) than cluster B (the antisocial, bor- 
derline, histrionic, and narcissistic per- 
sonality disorder spectrum). Five 
individuals had t scores higher than 65 for 
schizoid (38%), and five were higher than 
65 for schizotypal (38%). Consistent with 
expectations, 4 of the 13 had t scores 
higher than 65 for sadistic (31%). Over- 
all, the sample averaged 1.9 personality 
disorder diagnoses per individual (range 
0-6). 

DWNbltlon 

Figure 2. SNAP personality dimensions: extraversion 
versus disinhibition. 
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Figures 1 and 2 present the SNAP re- 
sults on the three normal personality di- 
mensions. Figure 1 shows the plot of the 
subjects' t scores on the dimensions of 
neuroticism (negative temperament) and 
extraversion (positive temperament). 
High scores on the neuroticism dimension 
would be associated with the type of 
symptomatology leading to cluster B di- 
agnoses, whereas low scores on the ex- 
traversion dimension would be more con- 
sistent with cluster A diagnoses. As 
shown in Figure 1, these youth scored in 
the range typical for college student 
males; three subjects had t scores lower 
than 40 and two had t scores higher than 
60. On the second dimension, however, 
most of the 13 subjects had scores below 
average ( t  < 50); there was only one 
subject with a t score above 55. whereas 5 
of the 13 had t scores lower than 40. 
Figure 2 plots the t scores for extraversion 
versus disinhibition. Overall, these sub- 
jects had low scores on both dimensions. 

Taken together, Figures I and 2 sug- 
gest that the 13 youth were reporting 
themselves as being relatively introverted 
and inhibited. This pattern on the normal 
personality dimensions was consistent 
with the dominance of cluster A symp- 
tomatology shown by these subjects. The 
only exceptions to this pattern were sub- 
ject 2 (who was slightly elevated on both 
extraversion and disinhibition) and sub- 
ject 6 (who had a very high t score on 
disinhibition). Subject 2 assisted a friend 
in sexually assaulting and killing the 
friend's girlfriend who had become preg- 
nant. The victim was an acquaintance of 
subject 2. Subject 6 raped and shot his 

stepsister while baby-sitting her, report- 
edly because she was pestering him. 

The mean PCL-R score for the group 
was 22.4 (range, 7.1 to 30.6). Those with 
conduct disorder had scores that averaged 
25.5, which is similar to the aforemen- 
tioned san~ples of young prison inmates 
with conduct disorder. ~ e l o ~ ~ ~  considers 
a PCL-R score between 20 and 29 to 
indicate a moderate psychopathic distur- 
bance. Moreover, the 12 subjects with 
conduct disorder clustered together fairly 
closely. 

As shown in Table 1 ,  two of the youths 
clearly differed from the rest by having 
low psychopathy scores (7.1 and 7.1). In 
addition to not having a conduct disorder, 
they were without a personality disorder 
diagnosis on the SNAP. Moreover, they 
were the only two in the sample who were 
functioning relatively well at school as 
judged by their grades (at least until the 
year of the crime. when their grades de- 
teriorated), not having failed a grade, not 
manifesting serious behavior problems at 
school, and not being in special education 
classes. 

One of the 20 PCL-R categories is 
"lack of remorse." Fifty percent (n  = 7) 
of the sample, when questioned, reported 
feeling little or no guilt over their crime. 
They responded with such statements as 
"I've never really felt guilt," "I have no 
guilt," "I don't feel guilt," and "I don't let 
it oppress me, I'm more mad at myself for 
the crime." 

Victimology The mean age of the 12 
victims was 24.2 years (range, 10 to 37 
years). There were a total of 12 victims, 
as two cases involved two offenders op- 
erating together. Seven of the victims 

J Am Acad Psychiatry Law, Vol. 25, No. 4, 1997 503 



Myers and Blashfield 

were white (58%) and five were black 
(42%); all were female. Two-thirds (n = 

8 )  of the victims were known by the of- 
fenders, while one-third ( n  = 4 )  were 
strangers. The most common relationship 
category was that of acquaintance, which 
described one-half of the offender-victim 
relationships. The victims all lived in the 
same city or town as the offenders and in 
the same neighborhood in a majority of 
the cases (n = 7 ;  58%). Most ( n  = 9;  
75%)  of the crimes occurred within the 
offenders' neighborhoods, and one-half 
( n  = 6 )  occurred in the victims' homes. 

Victims were classified according to 
whether they were high risk or low risk 
victims. High risk victims are those 
whose life circumstances and behaviors 
would increase their risk for becoming 
victims of violent crimes, such as prosti- 
tutes or those with a crack cocaine addic- 
tion. Low risk victims included those who 
were attacked in their homes. by a family 
member. or by an acquaintance whom 
they had no reason to fear. Nine (75%) of 
the 12 victims were low risk victims. 

Offender Background Information 
A chaotic family system was present in 
13 members (93%) of the sample. This 
was defined as parental abandonment or 
neglect, child abuse, unstable living ar- 
rangements with frequent geographical 
moves, parental incarceration, parental 
substance abuse, and/or serious parental 
arguinglfighting. Twelve (86%) of these 
boys had been abandoned or neglected by 
their fathers. The most common type of 
abuse was physical ( n  = 10: 69%),  fol- 
lowed by emotional ( n  = 9;  62%) and 
sexual (n  = 2: 15%). Additionally, family 
violence was present in 86 percent ( n  = 

12) of the youths' homes. This was de- 
fined as physical abuse of the child, phys- 
ical abuse of one spouse by another, or 
physical fighting between parents or adult 
family members witnessed by the child. 

Thirteen (93%) of the sample had a 
history of violent behaviors toward others 
before committing their crimes. This 
ranged from using weapons in fights to 
mugging to committing previous sexual 
assaults. The two most prevalent antiso- 
cial behavior markers were fighting 
(86%) and prior arrests (86%),  each 
found in 12 of the youths. Common rea- 
sons for arrest included battery, theft, and 
burglary. 

The mean school grade completed for 
the sample at the time of arrest was 9.0. 
All 14 of the youths had experienced sig- 
nificant academic problems, including a 
history of truancy ( n  = 13; 93%), suspen- 
sions ( n  = 10; 77%),  learning disabilities 
( n  = 8; 57%), and having failed at least 
one school grade ( n  = 7 ;  54%). Six 
(46%) had been in some form of special 
education classes, such as classes for the 
emotionally handicapped or the learning 
disabled, or in alternative schools for stu- 
dents with severe conduct problems. 

On a positive note. eleven (79%) of the 
subjects had been officially employed one 
or more times during their lives. Common 
jobs included restaurant work, lawnlland- 
scaping, and manual labor of various 
types. 

Sadistic Fantasy All but 1 of the 14 
youths were willing to be asked whether 
they experienced violent sexual fantasies 
antedating their crimes. One subject re- 
fused to answer questions regarding fan- 
tasies. Eight of the 12 youths (67%) ques- 
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tioned admitted to having violent sexual 
fantasies. Two had fantasized about 
crimes of rape and murder using a knife; 
one fantasized about raping, mutilating, 
and cutting out the victims' internal or- 
gans: one projected his sexually violent 
fantasies onto his victim, explaining that 
he had to repeatedly stab his victim to 
protect himself from her aggressive sex- 
ual advances; one had mentally planned 
out the kidnapping and rape-murder on 
the morning before the crime: one had 
aggressive thoughts towards prostitutes; 
and two had rape fantasies. 

Crime Characteristics The majority 
(rz  = 8; 67%) of these crimes was com- 
mitted by one juvenile acting alone. Six 
of the 14 subjects (43%) were under the 
influence of mind-altering substances at 
the time of the crimes, either marijuana or 
alcohol alone or a combination of the 
two. Twelve (86%) of the fourteen youths 
choose a victim of the same race. Vaginal 
intercourse was the most common form 
of sexual assault, carried out by nine 
(64%) of the group. Other sexual compo- 
nents of the crimes included attempted 
vaginal rape, oral rape, a threat of rape, 
and the fondling of victims. Weapons 
were used by all but 1 of the 14 youths as 
part of the physical attack, and 11  (79%) 
of the offenders had taken a knife to the 
crime scene. The most common weapon 
used by these boys in the attack of the 
victim was a cutting instrument (n = 9: 
64%), usually a knife. but in one case a 
pair of offenders used a shard of glass to 
cut the victim's neck. The second most 
common method of attack was the use of 
bludgeons (n = 6; 43%), followed by 
strangulations (n = 4: 29%), guns (n  = 2; 

14%), attempted neck-breaking (n  = 2; 
14%), and impalement ( n  = 1; 7%). 
These percentages add up to more than 
100 percent because multiple attack 
methods were used in half of the cases 
(50%). Overkill, the use of excessive 
trauma beyond that necessary to cause 
death. was present in four (33%) of the 
crimes. For example, in one case the vic- 
tim underwent a cutting of the throat, 
stabbings, strangulation with a cord, and 
bludgeoning with different objects. 

These sexual homicides were catego- 
rized using the organizedldisorganized 
dichotomy of the FBI Crime Classifica- 
tion ~ a n u a l . '  Six (43%) of these crimes 
were classified as the organized type. 
Evidence was available to show that 
these offenders planned the murders, 
targeted their victims, and displayed 
control at the crime scene. Five (36%) 
cases were classified as the disorga- 
nized type. In these crimes it  was evi- 
dent that the offender committed an un- 
planned, spontaneous act, usually 
against a known victim. The remaining 
three cases (2 1 %) were the mixed type, 
containing elements of both the orga- 
nized and disorganized type of sexual 
homicide. No relationship was found 
between the organizedldisorganized 
classification and Axis I disorders, per- 
sonality disorder diagnoses, psychopa- 
thy scores, presence of sexual fantasies, 
and sexual assault patterns. Admittedly, 
the small sample size lacked sufficient 
power to confidently accept these neg- 
ative findings: a much larger sample 
(N)  would be desired in testing such 
associations. 
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Discussion 
As expected, juvenile sexual homicide 

in this study was a rare crime, accounting 
for less than one percent of all juvenile 
murders in one state over a six-year pe- 
riod. The results of this study suggest that 
most juvenile sexual murderers, like other 
juvenile murderers, are an emotionally 
and behaviorally disturbed population of 
youth with identifiable psychopathology 
and personality disturbances. Yet, even in 
the highly specific population that this 
present study examined, a heterogeneous 
diagnostic picture was found. Whereas 
most of these youth had findings on both 
the Axis I and personality disorders clas- 
sification system of DSM-111-R, two sub- 
jects (No. 4 and No. 10) unexpectedly 
were without detectable mental illness or 
psychopathy score elevations. The only 
possible harbinger of their crimes was the 
presence of preexisting rape fantasies in 
both of them and two previous sexual 
assaults in one (subject 10). Curiously, 
this latter boy was not prosecuted for 
these assaults because they involved only 
the groping of two female strangers' 
breasts and buttocks, and his juvenile 
record was otherwise without a blemish. 

On the SNAP, it was interesting to find 
that these young men were not demon- 
strating symptomatology suggestive of 
Cluster B personality disorders, particu- 
larly antisocial and borderline. Moreover, 
only one youth met the criteria for anti- 
social personality disorder, an unexpected 
result in view of the brutal nature of these 
crimes. However, the PCL-R captured the 
psychopathic qualities present in the great 
majority of their personalities. 

Instead of cluster B personality diag- 
noses, a preponderance of these young 
men reported Cluster A symptoms includ- 
ing odd beliefs, behaviors, and experi- 
ences, interpersonal detachment and 
withdrawal from others, and suspicious- 
ness. In addition, most of these young 
men reported themselves as being rela- 
tively inhibited in their expression of 
emotions. This was an unexpected find- 
ing, as prisoners tend to be more extro- 
verted than normal adult populations.29 
This overall pattern was exemplified by 
subject 8, who met SNAP criteria for 
three personality disorders including 
schizoid, schizotypal. and avoidant. He 
had committed his crime in response to 
violent sexual fantasies, had known for 
weeks beforehand that his crime would be 
"bloody," and freely discussed being pre- 
occupied with his sadistic fantasy life. 

The high prevalence of a history of 
psychotic symptoms in these youths was 
not explained by the presence of major 
psychotic disorders. and it is unlikely that 
these symptoms were prodromal symp- 
toms of schizophrenia or related condi- 
tions. Instead, what appears to explain 
these symptoms is the frequent finding of 
Cluster A personality traits and disorders 
(the "odd, eccentric" category) in tandem 
with histories of child abuse, substance 
abuse, chaotic environments, and post- 
traumatic phenomena, all of which can 
contribute to unusual thoughts and per- 
ceptual experiences.30p32 

As in adult sexual murderers. violent 
sexual fantasies appeared to play a signif- 
icant role in the criminal actions of at 
least two-thirds of these young offenders. 
This is a much higher figure than the 23 
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percent prevalence of rape and/or murder 
fantasies found by Prentky et aL3' in 
adult single sexual murderers (one kill- 
ing); instead, it more closely approxi- 
mates their finding of violent sexual fan- 
tasies in 86 percent of adult serial killers. 
Whether this reflects developmental vari- 
ations or methodological differences (ar- 
chival data were relied upon to determine 
whether fantasies were present in the ma- 
jority of the adult single sexual murder- 
ers), or suggests that sexual homicide 
committed earlier leads to a higher risk of 
recidivism, is unknown. 

Given the sexual aspects of these crimes. 
the a priori expectation was that many of 
these young men would have been sexually 
abused themselves. This was not the case, 
in contrast to the Ressler et aL2 study of 36 
adult sexual murderers, of whom 43 percent 
reported childhood sexual abuse. 

Another notable difference was found 
in contrasting these youths with the adult 
sample of adult sexual murderers studied 
by Ressler et a1.' Their adult study pop- 
ulation was 92 percent white, while only 
55 percent of the juveniles in the current 
study were white. Sexual homicide has 
been considered a crime customarily 
committed by white  offender^.^ Aside 
from the age difference, another possible 
explanation is that the sample assessed by 
Ressler et al., by their report. was not 
randomly selected. 

One set of findings in our current study 
is particularly disturbing from the stand- 
point of recidivism. These 14 boys re- 
ceived prison sentences ranging from 4 to 
50 years, with an average sentence of just 
less than 20 years. Only two received 
multiple life sentences. Thus, with gain 

time nearly all of them will be released 
from prison by middle adulthood. and 
some by their early to mid-twenties. Two- 
thirds of these youths admitted to violent 
sexual fantasies, and one-half admitted to 
feeling little or no guilt over their crimes. 
This is a deadly combination, particularly 
when one realizes that this sample will 
receive virtually no treatment during their 
incarceration, and instead will complete 
their adolescent development and person- 
ality maturation in a prison setting sur- 
rounded by antisocial role models. 

Although we are only beginning to un- 
derstand the nature and motives of sexual 
homicide. instances of its occurrence 
have been found in literature for centu- 
ries. For example, this form of sadistic 
behavior was described by ~ o l t a i r e ' ~  in 
his novel Carzdide, originally published in 
1759. Candide, the protagonist of this 
work, observed the following scenes of 
"heroic butchery" after a battle: ". . . Here 
old men, covered with wounds, looked 
helplessly on, while their wives were dy- 
ing with their throats cut, and still holding 
their infants to their blood-stained breasts 
. . . young girls, ripped open after satisfy- 
ing the natural wants of several heroes. 
were breathing forth their last sighs; whle 
others again, half roasted, cried out for some- 
one to put them out of their agony." 

Acknowledgment 

The authors thank Paula Bryant, Director of 
Planning and Research at the Florida Department 
of Corrections, for her assistance with this project. 

References 

Douglas JE, Burgess AW, Burgess AG, 
Ressler RK: Crime Classification Manual. 
New York: Macmillan, 1992 

J Am Acad Psychiatry Law, Vol. 25, No. 4, 1997 



Myers and Elashfield 

2. Ressler RK, Burgess AW, Douglas JE: Sexual 
Homicide. Lexington, MA: Lexington Books, 
I988 

3. Stoller RJ: Perversion: The Erotic Form of 
Hatred. New York: Pantheon Books, 1975 

4. Maier HW: Katathyme wahnbildung und 
paranoia. Z Gesamte Neurol Psychiatric 13: 
555-610, 1912 

5. Revitch E, Schlesinger LB: Sex Murder and 
Sex Aggression. Springfield, IL: Charles C. 
Thomas, 1989 

6. Ressler RK, Burgess AW, Douglas JE, Hart- 
man CR, D'Agostino RB: Sexual killers and 
their victims: identifying patterns through 
crime scene analysis. J Interpers Violence 
1 :288-308, 1986 

7. Liebert JA: Contributions of psychiatric con- 
sultation in the investigation of serial murder. 
Int J Offender Ther Comp Crim 29: 187-200, 
1985 

8. Myers WC, Reccoppa L, Burton K, McElroy 
R: Malignant sex and aggression: an overview 
of serial sexual homicide. Bull Am Acad Psy- 
chiatry Law 2 1 :435-5 1, 1993 

9. Cornell DG: Causes of juvenile homicide: a 
review of the literature, in Juvenile Homicide. 
Edited by Benedek EP, Cornell DG. Wash- 
ington, DC: American Psychiatric Press, 1989 

10. Myers WC, Kemph JP: DSM-111-R classifica- 
tion of murderous youth: help or hindrance? 
J Clin Psychiatry 5 1:239-42, 1990 

11. Myers WC, Scott K, Burgess AW, Burgess 
AG: Psychopathology, biopsychosocial fac- 
tors, crime characteristics, and classification 
of 25 homicidal youths. J Am Acad Child 
Adolesc Psychiatry 34: 1483-9, 1995 

12. Yates A, Beutler LE, Crago M: Characteris- 
tics of young, violent offenders. J Psychiatry 
Law 137-49, 1984 

13. McLynn F: Famous Trials: Cases That Made 
History. Pleasantville, NY: Reader's Digest 
Association, 1979 

14. Krafft-Ebing R: Psychopathia Sexualis. 
Brooklyn, NY: Physicians and Surgeons Book 
Company, 1938 

15. Patterson RM: A psychiatric study of juve- 
niles involved in homicide. Am J Orthopsy- 
chiatry 13: 125-30, 1942 

16. Drzazga J: Sex Crimes. Springfield, 1L: 
Charles C. Thomas, 1960 

17. Russell DH: A study of juvenile murderers. J 
Offender Ther 10:55-86, 1966 

18. Ressler RK, Burgess AW, Douglas JE: Rape 
and rape-murder: one offender and twelve vic- 
tims. Am J Psychiatry 140:36-40, 1983 

19. Myers WC: Sexual homicide by adolescents. 
J Am Acad Child Adolesc Psychiatry 33: 
962-9, 1994 

20. U.S. Department of Justice: Crime in the 
United States 1994-FBI Uniform Crime Re- 
ports. Washington, DC: U.S. Government 
Printing Office, 1995 

21. Herjanic B, Campbell W: Differentiating psy- 
chiatrically disturbed children on the basis of 
a structured interview. J Abnorm Child Psy- 
chol 5: 127-34, 1977 

22. Clark LA: SNAP: Manual for Administration, 
Scoring and Interpretation. Minneapolis, MN: 
University of Minnesota Press, 1993 

23. Clark LE: Schedule for Nonadaptive and 
Adaptive Personality: Manual for Administra- 
tion, Scoring, and Interpretation. Minneapolis, 
MN: University of Minnesota Press, 1993 

24. Hare RD: The Revised Psychopathy Checklist. 
Vancouver, Canada: Department of Psychology, 
University of British Columbia, 1990 

25. Forth AE, Hart SD, Hare RD: Assessment of 
psychopathy in male young offenders. Psy- 
chol Assess 2:342-4, 1990 

26. Kosson DS, Nichols S, Newman JP: Assess- 
ment of psychopathy in a United States prison 
using Hare's 22-item checklist. Unpublished 
manuscript, University of Wisconsin, Madi- 
son, WI, 1985 

27. Schroeder ML, Schroeder KG, Hare RD: Gen- 
eralizability of a checklist for the assessment 
of psychopathy. J Consult Clin Psycho1 51: 
511-16, 1983 

28. Meloy JR: The Psychopathic Mind: Origins, 
Dynamics, and Treatment. Northvale, NJ: Ja- 
son Aronson, 1988 

29. Eysenck HJ, Eysenck MW: Manual for the 
Eysenck Personality Inventory. San Diego, 
CA: Educational and Industrial Testing Ser- 
vice, 1968 

30. Wilkins R: Delusions in children and teenagers 
admitted to Bethlem Royal Hospital in the 19th 
century. Br J Psychiatry 162:487-92, 1993 

3 1. Lukianowicz N: Hallucinations in non-psy- 
chotic children. Psychiatr Clin 2:321-37, 1969 

32. Lofgren DP, Bemporad J, King J, Lindem K, 
O'Driscoll G: A prospective follow-up of so- 
called borderline children. Am J Psychiatry 
148:11, 1991 

33. Prentky RA, Burgess AW, Rokous F, et al.: 
The presumptive role of fantasy in serial sex- 
ual homicide. Am J Psychiatry 146:887-91, 
1989 

34. Voltaire: Candide and Other Writings. New 
York: Barnes and Noble, 1995 

J Am Acad Psychiatry Law, Vol. 25, No. 4, 1997 


