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Forensic consultations with psychotic inpatients frequently include issues of risk 
management, such as dangerousness and civil commitment. An important dimen- 
sion of these consultations is the role of command hallucinations in producing an 
increased risk of aggressive behavior. In the present study, psychotic patients 
with command hallucinations (N = 27) were compared with patients with other 
hallucinations (N = 27) and with other psychotic patients (N = 30). The groups did 
not differ on aggressive behavior or most nonhallucinatory symptoms. However, 
most patients (84.0%) with command hallucinations had recently obeyed them. 
Among those with command hallucinations, almost one-half had heard and at- 
tempted to obey messages of self-harm during the last month. 

Forensic psychiatrists and psychologists 
are frequently asked to consult on the 
potential dangerousness of psychotic in- 
patients. Patients with hallucinations, par- 
ticularly command hallucinations, have 
traditionally evoked lasting concerns 
about dangerous behavior. Case reports 
of patients responding with blind obedi- 
ence to homicidal and suicidal com- 
mands, while often dramatic and atypical, 
underscore the demands placed on clini- 
cians for accurate risk assessments and 
effective interventions. 
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Studies are divided on the potential vi- 
olence associated with command halluci- 
nations. In a nonforensic setting, HeIler- 
stein et nl. ' found no increased aggression 
in 789 consecutive psychiatric admis- 
sions. They reported 151 patients with 
auditory hallucinations and 58 (38.4%) 
with command hallucinations: many had 
suicidal themes, but only a few had ho- 
micidal content. In contrast, Mitchell and 
vierkant2 found that command hallucina- 
tions varied widely in civilly committed 
patients by the type of psychosis: for 100 
inpatients with paranoid schizophrenia, 
11 of 20 (55.0%) had violent commands; 
a comparison group of 100 chronic co- 
caine abusers revealed that 50 had audi- 
tory hallucinations, but only 1 of 4 pa- 
tients had a violent hallucinatory 
command. These studies do not directly 
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address compliance with commands. 
Toward that end, Depp3 found in a study 
of inpatient assaults that 9 of 60 (15.0%) 
violent incidents were preceded by com- 
mand hallucinations. 

Two very recent studies underscore the 
importance of command hallucinations in 
general psychiatric settings. Zisook et aL4 
reviewed 141 outpatient files of persons 
with schizophrenia. They found, through 
secondary sources, that 27.0 percent of 
patients had not reported their command 
hallucinations to treating clinicians. Of 
the patients with command hallucina- 
tions, 20 (43.5%) reported violent com- 
mands. ~ u n ~ i n ~ e r '  conducted a Struc- 
tured Clinical Interview for DSM-111-R 
Diagnosis (SC1D)-based study of 93 in- 
patients with command hallucinations. 
Based on independent ratings by a re- 
search assistant, he found a greater pro- 
portion of patients not complying with 
commands (75.6%) to be dangerous than 
those who fully complied (40.0%). The 
interpretation of these results are ob- 
scured by the fact that many persons 
heard only nonviolent commands. There- 
fore, we do not know what proportion of 
patients with violent commands were 
dangerous, either because of these com- 
mands or for other reasons. 

Several forensic studies have high- 
lighted the risk potential of patients with 
command  hallucination^.^ In a pretrial fa- 
cility, Rogers and his colleagues7 found 
that patients with command hallucina- 
tions tended to have more aggressive 
content than those with non-command 
hallucinations and that substantial num- 
bers (44%) reported that they frequently 
responded to hallucinatory commands 

with unquestioning obedience. In an 
examination of insanity acquittees, 
Thompson et aL8 found that command 
hallucinations appeared to play a central 
role in the commission of offenses in 34 
of 234 cases (14.5%). However. in 62.0 
percent of the cases, command hallucina- 
tions played some role in the criminal 
activity during the episode prior to their 
arrest. 

In forensic consultations on dangerous- 
ness for patients suspected of command 
hallucinations, three interrelated ques- 
tions must be addressed. First, which 
symptoms assist in identifying patients 
with command hallucinations? Second, 
which symptoms predict violent com- 
mand hallucinations? Third, which symp- 
toms facilitate the prediction of compli- 
ance with command hallucinations? 

Available research offers only sketchy 
responses to these questions. Patients 
with command hallucinations are likely to 
be schizophrenicl~ 2. 557 and to manifest 
certain nonpsychotic symptoms: self re- 
proach, depersonalization, apnea. and no 
psychomotor retardati~n.~ They tend to 
comply with hallucinations of familiar 
voicess3 that are consistent with delu- 
sional  belief^.^ Although patients are less 
likely to obey violent than nonviolent 
 command^,^ this finding may simply re- 
flect the greater frequency of harmless 
commands. Because most prior studies 
were retrospective, we proposed to sys- 
tematically investigate clinical differ- 
ences among three inpatient groups of 
psychotic patients: command hallucina- 
tion (CH), non-command hallucination 
(NCH). and no hallucinations (NONE). 
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Method 
The participants were 86 psychotic in- 

patients from a state hospital and a com- 
munity hospital in Texas. All gave 
written informed consent. Inpatients were 
not approached for participation in the 
study until they had an opportunity to 
acclimatize to the unit and were recom- 
mended by the treatment staff. Partici- 
pants were classified into CH (n = 27), 
NCH (n = 27), and NONE (n = 32) 
groups. To clearly differentiate the three 
groups, we employed standard criteria 
proposed by Rogers et ~ 1 . ~ :  CH had com- 
mand hallucinations in the last 30 days; 
NCH had non-command hallucinations in 
the last 30 days and no command hallu- 
cinations in the last 12 months; NONE 
had no hallucinations in the last 12 
months. Consecutive sampling was em- 
ployed for the data collection until the 
NCH and NONE groups were adequately 
represented. We then oversampled CH 
patients until we had sufficient numbers 
in all three groups. 

Participants were administered the 
Schedule of Affective Disorders and 
Schizophrenia (SADS-c)," a semi-struc- 
tured interview of key symptomatology 
that integrates interview and file data. Pa- 
tients in the CH and NCH groups were 
also administered the Command Halluci- 
nation Questionnaire, developed by 
Resnick to examine the phenomenology 
of command hallucinations.' The three 
interviewers were doctoral students in 
clinical psychology who were trained in 
diagnostic interviews. As a check on 
SADS-C interrater reliability. joint inter- 
views were conducted on seven psychotic 

patients of whom four had command hal- 
lucinations. Despite florid symptomatol- 
ogy that often complicated the interview 
process, the interviewers achieved ade- 
quate reliability with a mean r for indi- 
vidual symptoms of .63 that compares 
favorably with reliability estimates for in- 
dividual symptoms on most structured in- 
te rv iew~. '~  

Results 
The study group consisted predomi- 

nantly of men (69.0%, n = 58); the mean 
age 2 SD was 40.30 -t 10.52. With re- 
spect to racial composition, the sample 
was 51 (60.7%) white, 26 (31.0%) Afri- 
can American, and 7 (8.1%) Hispanic 
American. The three groups did not differ 
on age, gender, or proportion of white 
subjects. For primary disorders, the par- 
ticipants had the following chart diag- 
noses: 47 (54.7%) schizophrenia, 13 
(15.1 %) bipolar disorder, 9 (10.5%) 
schizoaffective disorder, 5 (5.8%) psy- 
chosis not otherwise specified (NOS). 4 
(4.7%) major depression, 8 (9.3%) other 
disorders. 

Participants in the CH group tended to 
hear both harmless and violent commands 
(see Table 1). Of the 25 patients that 
could articulate the nature of their com- 
mand hallucinations, only 4 (16.0%) had 
not obeyed a command in the last 30 
days. For the purposes of this study, 
"obeyed" is defined operationally as com- 
pliance with the hallucinatory command 
or a significant portion of the command. 
Most patients with harmless commands 
or commands for self-harm had recently 
obeyed them. Violent commands toward 
others were less common and less fre- 
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Table 1 
Content and Compliance with Potentially Dangerous Command Hallucinations by Psychotic 

Inpatients for the Most Recent 30 Days 

Heard by the Patient, Obeyed by the Patient, 
Type of Command 

-- 
N (%)a N (%)b 

Harmless command 20 (80.0) 18 (90.0) 
Violent toward self 12 (48.0) 11 (91.7) 
Violent toward others 9 (36.0) 6 (66.7) 
Total 25 (1 00.0) 21 (84.0) 

"Percentages are based on 25 patients with command hallucinations; two additional patients were unable to 
articulate the nature of their command hallucinations. 
bPercentages are based on the number of patients with this type of command; they reflected the proportion of 
patients who obeyed this command at least once during the last 30 days. 

quently obeyed. Taken together, these 
data suggest that command hallucina- 
tions, including those with violent con- 
tent. are commonly obeyed by nonforen- 
sic psychotic inpatients. 

We examined whether patients from 
the CH group posed a greater risk of 
violence than their NCH and NONE 
counterparts. We found no significant dif- 
ferences on the SADS-C with respect to 
suicidal tendencies or aggressive behav- 
ior. We conducted a chart review and 
interviewed patients about suicidal and 
aggressive behavior in the last 12 months; 
we found that more than one-half (48, or 
55.8%) had engaged in violent behavior. 
However. we were unable to establish 
significant differences among the three 
groups. Original plans to assess predic- 
tors of compliance with harmless and vi- 
olent commands could not be carried out 
because so few participants had not 
obeyed at least one of these commands in 
the last 30 days. 

An important question is whether spe- 
cific symptoms can assist in identifying 
persons with command hallucinations 
who are not forthcoming about these 

symptoms. Toward this objective, we 
computed ANOVAs with Duncan's mul- 
tiple range tests to evaluate differences 
among the three groups. To protect 
against type I error, only F ratios with p 
< .O1 were considered significant. We 
found that greater levels of depersonal- 
ization differentiated the CH group from 
the NCH and NONE groups (F = 6.59. 
df = 2.8 1, p < .01). In addition, bizarre 
behavior was more severe among the CH 
and NCH than the NONE group (F = 

6.54, df = 2.81, p < .01). 

Discussion 
Our findings suggest most psychotic 

inpatients with command hallucinations 
obey them even during their hospital stay. 
We were unable to collect more precise 
data on the frequency and compliance 
with hallucinations, because patients 
were too impaired to provide adequate 
estimates. Still, the current data fly in the 
face of earlier  assertion^'^ that nonforen- 
sic patients are unlikely to obey halluci- 
natory commands. We were also sur- 
prised to find the frequency of self-harm 
commands and the likelihood that these 
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would be obeyed at some point in a 30- 
day period. Moreover, violence toward 
others, while less likely to be present, 
poses a significant threat, despite treat- 
ment efforts. 

Patients in public facilities often pose 
management risks because of aggressive 
behaviors toward self and o t h e n 3  w e  
found that the risk of violence appeared 
no greater for psychotic patients with 
command hallucinations than those with 
non-command hallucinations or no hallu- 
cinations. Psychiatrists can find little 
comfort in this finding; they still need to 
assess thoroughly antecedent symptoms 
of aggression. At least in this study, com- 
mand hallucinations with a violent con- 
tent appear to signal a substantial risk of 
aggressive behavior, particularly when 
the content includes self-harm. 

Rogers et aL6 identified four SADS 
symptoms that differentiated patients 
with command hallucinations from other 
psychotic patients. Of the three symptoms 
included on the SADS-C, we confirmed 
the potential usefulness of depersonaliza- 
tion as a possible indicator of command 
hallucinations. As the first nonarchival 
study to compare nonforensic patients 
with and without command hallucina- 
tions, these data question earlier beliefs 
about psychotic inpatients and their lack 
of propensity to obey harmless and vio- 
lent commands. Larger studies may be 
successful in establishing predictor vari- 
ables for differentiating patients with 
command hallucinations who pose a high 
risk of obedience. 

The compilation of research, including 
the current study, has several important 
implications for forensic consultations. 

These implications are enumerated be- 
low. 

1 .  Command hallucinations, by them- 
selves, may not pose an increased risk for 
aggressive behavior when compared to 
other psychotic inpatients. However, 
knowledge of command hallucinations 
may be critical in understanding the an- 
tecedents and causal factors of aggression 
in specific patients. Therefore, a thorough 
assessment of command hallucinations is 
often essential. 

2. Many patients are not forthcoming 
about command hallucinations in either 
forensic8 or nonforensic4 settings. In 
cases in which command hallucinations 
are suspected but not documented, clini- 
cal inquiries about depersonalization may 
be an indirect and useful approach. 

3. Complete denial of any obedience 
to commands should be questioned. The 
present data are consistent with past re- 
search5, g that most patients have harm- 
less commands and frequently obey them. 
Even with violent commands toward self 
and others. the >majority appear to have 
obeyed them sometime in the recent past. 

4. Obedience to violent commands 
must be understood from the patient's 
perspective and assessed on a continuum. 
Patients often interpret hallucinatory 
commands based on their psychotic 
thinking. The forensic clinician must un- 
derstand not only the content of the com- 
mand but also the patient's understanding 
and response. Research on command hal- 
lucinations tends to characterize them as 
present or absent. From a clinical per- 
spective. the type and extent of obedience 
is also important. For example. some pa- 
tients make threatening gestures in re- 
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sponse to homicidal commands. Other 
patients attempt to fully cany out com- 
mands where the likelihood of interven- 
tion is very high (e.g., a suicide attempt in 
full view of clinical staff). Still others 
exercise care and even planning in 
response to command hallucinations. 
Risk assessment must take into account 
both the extent of the obedience as well as 
its 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

likelihood of success. 
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